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EDITORIAL

FYI: This Message Will Interrupt You –  
Texting Impact on Clinical Learning Environment

Irsk Anderson, MD*; Vineet M. Arora, MD, MAPP

Section of General Internal Medicine, Department of Medicine, University of Chicago, Chicago, Illinois.

F ifteen years ago, beepers with 5-digit call-back num-
bers were the norm. Pushing a call light button out-
side the patient’s room to flag the desk clerk that a 
new order had been hand-written was all part of the 

lived experience of residency. Using that as our baseline, we 
have clearly come a long way in the way that we communicate 
with other clinicians in hospitals. Communication among the 
patient care team in the digital age predominantly involves 
bidirectional messaging using mobile devices. The approach 
is both immediate and convenient. Mobile devices can im-
prove work efficiency, patient safety, and quality of care, but 
their main advantage may be real-time bedside decision sup-
port.1,2 However, the widespread use of mobile devices for 
communication in healthcare is not without its concerns. First 
and foremost, there has been abundant literature around short 
message service (SMS) use in the healthcare setting, and there 
are concerns surrounding both threats to privacy and the prev-
alence and impact of interruptions in clinical care. 

The first SMS was sent in 1992.3 Text messaging since then has 
become ubiquitous, even in healthcare, raising concerns around 
the protection of patient health information under the Health 
Insurance Portability and Accountability Act (HIPAA). Interest-
ingly, the United States Department of Health and Human Ser-
vices Office for Civil Rights, enforcer of HIPAA, is tech neutral on 
the subject.3 Multiple studies have assessed physician stances 
on SMS communication in the healthcare setting using routine, 
non-HIPAA-compliant mobile phones. Overall, 60%-80% of re-
spondents admitted to using SMS in patient care, while in anoth-
er study, 72% and 80% of Internal Medicine residents surveyed 
found SMS to be the most efficient form of communication and 
overall preferred method of communication, respectively.3,4 In-
terestingly, 82.5% of those same residents preferred the hospi-
tal-based alphanumeric paging system for security purposes, 
even though Freundlich et al. make a compelling argument that 
unidirectional alphanumeric paging systems are most certainly 
less HIPAA compliant, lacking encryption and password protec-
tion.5 Newer platforms that enable HIPAA-compliant messaging 
are promising, although they may not be fully adopted by clini-
cal teams without full-scale implementation in hospitals.6

In addition to privacy concerns with SMS applications on 
mobile phones, interruptions in healthcare – be it from phone 
calls, emails, text messages, or in-person conversations – are 
common. In fact, famed communication researcher Enrico 
Coeira has notoriously described healthcare communication 
as ”interrupt-driven.”7 Prior work has shown that frequent in-
terruptions in the healthcare setting can lead to medication 
prescription errors, errors in computerized physician order en-
try, and even surgical procedural errors.8-10 

While studies have focused on interruptions in clinical care in 
the healthcare setting, little is known about how education may 
be compromised by interruptions due to mobile devices. Text 
messaging during dedicated conference time can lead to inad-
equate learning and a sense of frustration among residents. In 
this issue of the Journal of Hospital Medicine, Mendel et al. per-
formed a quality improvement study involving eight academic 
inpatient clinical training units with the aim of reducing nonur-
gent text messages during education rounds.11 Their unique 
interventions included learning sessions, posters, adding alerts 
to the digital communication platform, and alternative messag-
ing options. Of four sequential interventions, a message alerting 
the sender that they will be interrupting educational rounds and 
suggesting a “delayed send” or “send as an FYI” showed the 
greatest impact, reducing the number of text interruptions per 
team per educational hour from 0.81 to 0.59 (95% CI 0.51-0.67). 
When comparing a four-week pre-intervention sample with a 
four-week end-intervention sample, the percentage of nonur-
gent messages decreased from 82% to 68% (P < .01). 

While these results are promising, challenges to large-scale 
implementation of such a program exist. Buy-in from the ancil-
lary healthcare team is critical for such interventions to succeed 
and be sustained. It also places a burden of “point triage” on 
the healthcare team members, who must assess the patient 
situation and determine the level of urgency and whether to 
immediately interrupt, delay interrupt or send an FYI message.  
For example, in the study by Mendel et al.,11 it is noteworthy 
that urgent patient care issues were mislabeled as “FYI” in 
2% of patients. While this is a seemingly low rate, even one of 
these mislabeled messages could result in significant adverse 
patient outcomes and should be considered a “never event.” 
Finally, the study used a messaging platform with program-
ming flexibility and IT personnel to assist. This could be cost 
prohibitive for some programs, especially if rolled out to an 
entire institution. 

Communication is critical for effective patient care and un-
fortunately, the timing of such communication is often not 
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orderly but rather, chaotic. Text message communication can 
introduce interruptions into all aspects of patient care and ed-
ucation, not only dedicated learning conferences. If the goal is 
for all residents to attend all conferences, it seems impossible 
(and likely dangerous) to eliminate all messaging interruptions 
during conference hours. Nevertheless, it is worth noting that 
Mandel et al. have moved us creatively toward that goal with 
a multifaceted approach.11 Future work should address more 
downstream outcomes, such as objective resident learning re-
tention and adverse patient events relative to the number of 
interruptions per educational hour. If such studies showed im-
proved learning outcomes and fewer adverse patient events, 
the next step would be to further strengthen and refine their 
protocol with real-time and scheduled feedback sessions 
between providers and other patient care team members in 
addition to the continued search for additional innovative ap-
proaches. In addition, combining artificial intelligence or pre-
dictive modeling may help us delineate when an interruption 
is warranted, for example, when a patient is at high clinical risk 
without intervention. Likewise, human factors research may 
help us understand the best way to time and execute an inter-
ruption to minimize the risk to clinical care or education. After 
all, the ideal system would not eliminate interruptions entirely 
but allow clinicians to know when someone should be inter-
rupted and when they do not need to be interrupted. 
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