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VALOR: A Win-Win for VA Medical Centers and BSN Students

The VA Learning Opportunity 
Residency (VALOR) is a 
national program that was 
established to attract and 

retain highly qualified, well educated 
nurses in the VA health care system. 
According to Marisa Palkuti, director 
of the VA’s Health Care Retention 
and Recruitment Office, the impetus 
for this effort is to adjoin with 
the nursing hiring pipeline and 
encourage newly graduated nurses to 
apply for employment at the VA (oral 
communication, May 2010).

The VALOR program began in 
1990 and provides the opportunity 
for senior students of baccalaureate 
nursing programs (BSNs) that are 
accredited by the National League 
for Nurses or the Commission on 
Collegiate Nursing Education to par-
ticipate in a paid, hands-on learning 
experience through a residency at 
a VA medical center (VAMC). The 
program requirements are uniform 
nationwide and require each student 
to be a citizen of the United States, to 
have a minimum grade point average 
of 3.0, and to not have an employ-
ment commitment following gradu-
ation. In other words, the VALOR 
student should be free to apply for 
employment at the VA. Prospective 
candidates also must provide tran-
scripts and letters of reference from 2 
faculty members and the dean of their 
school of nursing. VA facilities that 

are interested in participating in the 
VALOR program must request posi-
tions in a written proposal submitted 
to Glenda Fuller at the Healthcare 
Retention and Recruitment Office in 
New Orleans, Louisiana. The chosen 
facilities receive between 1 and 10 
VALOR positions.

Each of the 2 phases of the nursing 
VALOR program provides the BSN 
student with 400 hours of experience. 
VALOR I occurs over the summer 
months and VALOR II occurs during 
the academic school year until the 
student graduates. After completing 
VALOR I, the student can opt to par-
ticipate in VALOR II. According to 
Mike Smith, human resource special-
ist at the Salem VA Medical Center 
(SVAMC), Salem, Virginia, the VALOR 
student earns 80% of registered nurse 
(RN)-1 level-1 pay, which is based on 
geographic location. Students who 
participate in the VALOR program 
and are subsequently hired after grad-
uation start at a higher pay rate com-
pared with new graduates who did 
not participate in the program (oral 
communication, May 2010).  

One of the goals of the VALOR 
program is to increase the student’s 
skill level with the use of a BSN 
preceptor who mentors the student 
one-on-one. The students receive a 
variety of experiences in, but not lim-
ited to, the following areas: intensive 
care, step down, emergency medicine, 
psychiatry, radiology, women’s health, 
oncology, home health, and the oper-
ating room. They also attend lec-
tures, see autopsies, and spend time 
with various health care professionals 
employed in respiratory care, micro-
biology, and physical therapy to learn 
each aspect of the interdisciplinary 
health care team. Each student also 

spends a few days with a nurse practi-
tioner to learn how to perform physi-
cal assessments—an essential skill for 
the new nurse. 

In addition, students obtain experi-
ence in creating a presentation. They 
present a team research project to 
staff nurses and the nurse executive 
committee that incorporates a litera-
ture review involving evidenced-based 
nursing practices. In past years, proj-
ects have included horizontal violence 
and the oral-systemic disease connec-
tion. The VALOR program also pro-
vides the student with input into their 
educational needs. Presenting an array 
of clinical opportunities based on the 
student’s interest, the VALOR program 
allows the student to explore various 
roles of the RN. Exposing students to 
a wide range of experiences can help 
them decide what specialty to pursue 
following graduation. This program 
has proven to be a win-win, both for 
the VA (from a recruitment point of 
view) and for the students who receive 
hands-on learning experiences.

The Experience of the  
VALOR Student
Looking at the program through the 
VALOR student’s eyes can reflect how 
truly important the program is to the 
development of future nurses. Danielle 
Whitley, a 2007 VALOR student at the 
SVAMC and current employee of the 
VA, contends, “Being able to see sev-
eral different units in the hospital gave 
me an overview of what I might be 
interested in doing and made me com-
fortable applying at the VA for a job” 
(oral communication, August 2009). 
Regan Levidiotis, a 2008 VALOR 
student and current employee at the 
SVAMC, states, “The VALOR made me 
want to work at the VA for my career. 
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I may have considered it, but the 
VALOR sealed the deal. My experience 
exposed me to the veteran population. 
The culture is diverse and we are all 
united by our concerns for the veter-
ans and caring for them” (oral com-
munication, August 2009). Jonathon 
Pender, a 2009 VALOR student at the 
SVAMC, says, “As a student, we expe-
rienced many feelings. Some pleasant 
and noble, especially when a patient 
who had been admitted a month ago 
finally takes his first steps out of the 
VA to go home to a loving family. You 
take pride in knowing you were an 
integral part of this patient’s success. 
Some emotions were not as pleasant 
and confirmed just how cruel the 
world and life can be. We often shared 
experiences with our cohorts and pre-
ceptors. I remember my first code 
experience, standing there shaking 
while the adrenaline rushed through 
my system and a feeling of helpless-
ness came over me. Then I remember 
the thank you from a patient and how 
remarkably proud I am to be in health 
care. As VALOR students, we were 
presented with most of the tasks and 
duties of an RN. We were expected to 
be proficient in medicine, drugs, and 
disease progression. Our preceptors 
challenged us to rise to the occasion 
and to be confident in our practice. 
As a novice, the opportunity to work 
with such seasoned nurses was price-
less” (oral communication, September 
2009).

VALOR as a Recruitment Tool
According to a conversation with 
Smith, “The VALOR program can 
help facilities recruit for nursing posi-
tions that are difficult to fill. From 
2005 to 2008, 55% of the VALORs 
[students] who participated in the 
program [at the SVAMC] have been 
hired” (oral communication, May 
2010). Additionally, considering the 
VALOR students who are participat-
ing in the program in 2009 (graduat-

ing in 2010) at the SVAMC, 4 students 
plan to apply for positions at the facil-
ity and 1 student plans to apply at a 
VAMC in another state. 

According to Fuller, who is a VA 
human resources recruitment and 
retention specialist, in 2008, there 
were 402 nursing students in the 
VALOR program nationwide and 139 
were subsequently hired at the VA. In 
2009, 235 of 651 participants were 
hired at the VA. Taking into account 
the current budget constraints and 
hiring freezes, the program is success-
ful considering how many VALOR 
students have been hired during these 
2 years. In previous years, the hiring 
rates were about 50% (oral commu-
nication, May 2010). Palkuti says, 
“There is the growing realization that 
the supply of appropriately prepared 
health care workers in this country 
is inadequate to meet the needs of a 
growing and diverse population” (oral 
communication, October 2009).

The U.S. Department of Health and 
Human Services estimates that 2.8 
million nurses will be needed by 2020; 
this will result in a 36% vacancy rate. 
Today, there is approximately a 10% 
vacancy rate.1 However, from 2000 
to 2020, nursing demand is projected 
to grow by 40% and supply is esti-
mated to increase by only 6%, thus, 
creating a shortage of RNs.2 Training 
programs and residencies such as the 
VALOR program benefit the VA health 
care system. Approximately 100,000 
health profession trainees throughout 
the nation come to the VHA each year 
for clinical training.3 These trainees 
become a recruitment pool. The goal 
of the VA is to actively recruit these 
students to become full-time employ-
ees following graduation.3

 The VALOR program is not just 
limited to nursing; the VA also sup-
ports VALOR programs for medical 
technology. In 2007, the pharmacy 
VALOR program also was added to 
address the VA’s need for pharmacists.3

For fiscal year (FY) 2010, 350 new 
VALOR I positions were approved 
for nursing, 3 positions for medical 
technology, and 46 positions for phar-
macology students. In addition, 506  
students are continuing in the 
VALOR II program. The total cost 
of the VALOR program for FY 2010 
is reported to be $5,097,039 (Fuller 
and Palkuti, oral communication, 
May 2010). According to Palkuti, 
even considering the current budget-
ary issues, the VALOR program will 
remain viable for the near future. 

The VALOR program has proven to 
be a valuable tool for recruiting recent 
BSN graduates at the SVAMC. The 
National Advisory on Nurse Education 
and Practice projected that, by 2010, 
two-thirds of the nursing workforce 
should hold a BSN.4 Although that 
initiative for U.S. nurses has not been 
met, the VALOR program can help 
the VA meet this objective. According 
to Susan Lundy, VA nursing outcomes 
database coordinator for the SVAMC, 
as of 2009, 57% of direct care VA RNs 
nationwide have a bachelor’s degree. 
However, this includes nursing and 
non-nursing degrees (oral communi-
cation, May 2010).

Conclusion
The previous VALOR students who 
are now working as RNs contend 
they had a smoother transition from 
student to the RN role compared 
with their classmates. They attribute 
this to the VALOR experience. From 
talking with the present and previ-
ous  VALOR participants, the com-
mon consensus is that the program 
gives them self-confidence; they walk 
away from the experience having a 
better understanding of the nursing 
profession. � ●

Author disclosures
The authors report no actual or poten-
tial conflicts of interest with regard to 
this column. 



JULY 2010 • FEDERAL PRACTITIONER • 33 

PRACTITIONER FORUM

Disclaimer
The opinions expressed herein are those 
of the authors and do not necessarily 
reflect those of Federal Practitioner, 
Quadrant HealthCom Inc., the U.S. gov-
ernment, or any of its agencies. This 
article may discuss unlabeled or inves-
tigational use of certain drugs. Please 
review complete prescribing informa-

tion for specific drugs or drug com-
binations—including indications, con-
traindications, warnings, and adverse 
effects—before administering pharma-
cologic therapy to patients.
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