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FDA Panel Rejects OTC Switch for Lovastatin
B Y  E L I Z A B E T H  M E C H C AT I E

Senior Writer

S I LV E R S P R I N G ,  M D.  —  F or the third
time since 2000, Merck & Co. failed to
convince Food and Drug Administration
advisory panelists that lovastatin should be
made available over the counter.

At a joint meeting, the FDA’s Nonpre-
scription Advisory Committee and En-
docrinologic and Metabolic Drugs Advi-
sory Committee voted 10-2, with one
abstention, that lovastatin should not be
approved as a nonprescription drug, based
on the data provided by the company. The
data included the results of a trial evaluat-
ing how consumers self-select for treat-
ment with lovastatin. The panelists voted
11-2 that the results of the study did not
show that OTC consumers could make an
appropriate self-selection decision.

Merck filed for approval for OTC use of
a fixed daily 20-mg dose of lovastatin,
marketed as Mevacor, “to help lower cho-
lesterol, which may prevent a first heart at-
tack,” focusing on a moderate-risk popu-
lation. This population, identified using
National Cholesterol Education Program
(NCEP) ATP III guidelines, comprised
men aged at least 45 years and women
aged at least 55 years with moderately
high LDL cholesterol (130 mg/dL to 170
mg/dL) and one additional CHD risk fac-
tor. Merck’s main argument was that the
OTC availability of lovastatin would in-
crease access and use among the large, un-
dertreated population of people with high
cholesterol, and would result in significant
public health benefits.

The panel generally agreed that lovas-
tatin was a safe and effective medication.
But they were concerned that the results
of the study indicated that a substantial
proportion of patients who were actually
high risk and should have been on a pre-
scription statin, under a physician’s super-
vision, would self-select for a statin. Like-
wise, a substantial proportion of people
who were low risk and not candidates for
therapy would also self-select for a statin.
Other concerns were the lack of actual use
studies in real-world situations. 

“Patients couldn’t figure out whether
the drug was for them,” said Dr. William
Shrank of the division of pharmacoepi-
demiology and pharmacoeconomics at
Harvard Medical School, Boston.

“In my view, the benefits greatly out-
weigh the risks,” said Dr. Thomas Picker-
ing, director of the behavioral cardiovas-
cular health and hypertension program at
Columbia University, New York. Dr. Pick-
ering voted in favor of approval. Describing
the statins as an “incredibly safe” group of
drugs, he said there is “a huge, unmet need
for people who should be taking statins and
who are not, and this offers a plausible way
for getting them all to take them.” 

The FDA usually follows the advice of its
advisory panels. This is the third time that
the advisory panels have met to vote on ap-
proval since 2000. At the second meeting in
January 2005, the panels voted 20-3 against
approval for the OTC switch, citing prob-
lems with the label comprehension study
and doubts about whether patients could
properly self-select for treatment.

Since then, Merck made substantial
changes to the label and accompanying
materials, and conducted another self-se-
lection study of more than 1,400 partici-
pants at 14 U.S. sites, in a simulated retail
setting in which a pharmacist was available
to answer questions. The Self-Evaluation of
Lovastatin to Enhance Cholesterol Treat-
ment (SELECT) study evaluated two labels
(one with LDL cholesterol information
and one with total cholesterol information
as eligibility criteria) that patients used to

determine whether the drug was appro-
priate for them and whether they would
buy the product. Labels also included in-
formation on absolute and relative safety
warnings and a decision tree.

About 72% of the participants were cor-
rect in determining whether lovastatin was
appropriate for them, with either label.
Most of the correct decisions were that the
drug was not appropriate. For example, of
the 662 participants who were in the LDL
cholesterol label arm, 439 correctly deter-

mined that the drug was not appropriate
and 34 correctly determined that it was ap-
propriate, for a total of 71.5%.

The materials included in the redesigned
package were a refrigerator magnet re-
minding people to call their physicians if
they experienced muscle pains, a “heart
healthy” living guide, and cards for con-
sumers to give to pharmacists and physi-
cians saying they were taking lovastatin. 

The FDA is expected to make a decision
by the end of January. ■


