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HT Thrombosis Risk Tied to Coagulation Factors
B Y  F R A N  L O W RY

Orlando Bureau

AT L A N TA —  Women who opt for hor-
mone therapy to ease their discomfort
from hot flashes and other menopausal
symptoms often do so without knowing
their risk of developing adverse effects.

Now, data from the Women’s Health
Initiative trials of hormone therapy (HT)
may help women make more informed
decisions about their risk for venous
thromboembolism, should they choose
to resume or start hormones.

A nested case-control study from the
WHI presented at the annual meeting of
the American Society of Hematology has
found that excessively high levels of the co-
agulation factor D-dimer, in the presence

of HT, significantly increases a woman’s
risk of developing venous thrombosis.

“If your D-dimer was in the top quarter
of population distribution and you were as-
signed to HT, your relative risk of deep vein
thrombosis was increased sixfold, com-
pared to women whose D-dimer was low
and who were assigned placebo,” principal
investigator Dr. Mary Cushman, professor
of medicine at the University of Vermont,
Burlington, said. “This means that you go
from a one or two per thousand annual risk
to about a 6-12 per thousand annual risk.
This type of information might be helpful
to women deciding for or against HT.”

Other factors that were found to be as-
sociated with an elevated venous throm-
bosis risk in the presence of HT included
lower free protein S and plasmin-antiplas-
min complex (PAP), a research-based test.

Dr. Cushman and her colleagues mea-
sured baseline levels of potential coagula-
tion risk factors to see if they could pinpoint
women at higher risk of venous thrombo-
sis with hormones. They did a nested case-
control study that measured baseline levels
of these factors in 215 participants of the
WHI who developed venous thrombosis,
and 867 age-matched controls.

The women were all participants of two
placebo-controlled double-blind random-
ized WHI trials evaluating the following
regimens: conjugated equine estrogens
alone, or estrogen plus medroxyproges-
terone acetate. The mean age of the
women in the analysis was 66 and ranged
from 50 to 79 years.

The investigators studied procoagulant,
anticoagulant, and fibrinolytic markers in
blood samples that were taken at the time
the women entered the WHI studies. 

They found that women who had low
levels of protein C, free protein S, and an-
tithrombin, and high levels of D-dimer,
PAP, and prothrombin fragment 1-2 had an
elevated risk of venous thromboem-
bolism. The highest risk was associated

with women who had D-dimer in the top
quartile and who were taking HT.

In an interview, Dr. Cushman cautioned
that testing for D-dimer is not yet ready for
prime time because there are currently no
standardized tests specifically designed to
gauge venous thrombosis risk.

“There are various D-dimer assays
commercially available, but choosing a
proper threshold and so forth among all
the different commercially available as-
says is a challenge,” she said. “We used a

particular assay in our analysis, and stud-
ies would be needed assessing other assays
before using this in clinical practice.”

Nevertheless, D-dimer is a biomarker
with the potential to identify 25% of
women at risk for venous thromboem-
bolism. Being able to tell those women
their risk should they choose to go on HT
would be very useful in helping them
think carefully about the treatment, Dr.
Cushman said.

She is doubtful that her results will be

replicated in other studies. “In terms of
confirming the findings, it’s difficult be-
cause there’s probably not going to be an-
other large study like this. But this is def-
initely something that could be tested
further. The most important take home is
the translation about what we are begin-
ning to understand about the pathophys-
iology and the additive nature of these co-
agulation factor abnormalities. The
potential for clinical applicability is po-
tentially there.” ■

‘This type of
information might
be helpful to
women deciding
for or against’
hormone therapy.
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