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In this issue of the Journal, William T. Merkel, 
PhD, a family therapist, raises the question of 
whether family physicians should be treating the 
family unit.1 It is tempting at first to regard this 
piece as the clarion call to yet another turf battle, 
especially since the author recites the usual terri­
torial arguments, such as the following: “The field 
is too complicated even for the specialists.” “You 
family physicians don’t know enough about this 
area.” “ How will you figure your charges?” But 
beyond these commonplace arguments over turf, 
there is a major and significant issue that should 
be addressed. The most unfortunate aspect of 
Merkel’s approach to this important subject lies in 
its intellectual development and involves the fact 
that the primary question—as stated in the title—is 
based on an incorrect assumption not supported 
by the scientific evidence about the relationship 
between the family system and health and illness. 
Merkel believes that family physicians became in­
terested in patients’ families for political reasons 
and that it is therefore possible simply to divorce 
the family system from the medical care equation. 
Research data show otherwise.

The assumption that the family can be elective- 
ly excised from family practice is not supported 
by work that documents the relationship between 
dysfunction of the family system and the causes 
of illness, including increased morbidity and mor­
tality for streptococcal infections, tuberculosis, 
pneumonia, cerebrovascular accident, and a vari­
ety of cardiovascular illnesses including athero­
sclerotic coronary artery disease.2 Other work has 
revealed a relationship between the functioning of
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the family system and the course or treatment of 
illness including progress in rehabilitation pro­
grams,3 compliance with prescribed medical regi­
mens,4 treatment of chemical dependence,5 and 
treatment of schizophrenia.6 Furthermore, work is 
underway today in a number of family medicine 
departments that examines the influence of the 
family system on reproduction (University of 
Washington and University of Oklahoma), on the 
course and treatment of chronic obstructive pul­
monary disease (University of Oklahoma), on the 
attack rates and immune response to influenza in­
fection (University of Oklahoma), and on the re­
currence of herpes simplex infections (Case West­
ern Reserve University). Thus, the evidence of 
much investigative activity supports the conten­
tion that the family plays a major and nonelective 
role in health and illness. The family did not 
“ marry into” family medicine but was there from 
the beginning and represents the unique focus that 
differentiates family medicine from the other pri­
mary care medical specialties.

The general practice founders of the family 
practice specialty acquired a great deal of knowl­
edge about family systems (as have many current 
family physicians, even though such knowledge is 
not expressed in systems terminology) that was 
used to care effectively for the family unit. Gen­
eral practitioners developed their knowledge of 
family systems through repetitive observations 
and interactions with the family and its members 
during the course of home visits. General practi­
tioners, possessing little of today’s scientific arma­
mentarium, had to rely on knowledge and skill in 
treating the patient in the context of the family 
through participation in the important comings 
(births) and goings (deaths) of ail family members. 
The challenge that excites so many family medi­
cine researchers today involves unraveling and
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scientifically documenting these relationships that 
the general practitioner knew so well and integrat­
ing them into the biomedical facts of life as we 
know them.

Rather than considering the divorce of a non­
existent marriage, we should applaud the growing 
emphasis on the family system in medicine today, 
as exemplified by the publication of a new journal, 
Family Systems Medicine (published by Brunner/ 
Mazel). In fact, I believe that an exciting new sci­
ence is developing. I propose that the new science 
be called family medicine and that it primarily de­
scribe the relationships between the family system 
and the body’s three major regulatory systems: the 
nervous, immune, and endocrine systems. The 
new science would secondarily define the family 
system's involvement through the body’s regula­
tory systems with a number of biologic or clinical 
processes such as disease, aging, and reproduc­
tion. The language of family medicine would be 
developed from molecular biology and chemistry 
and from family social sciences. An important char­
acteristic of the new science is that it would evolve 
from the collaborative efforts of workers in differ­
ent fields: basic, clinical, and behavioral sciences.

The development of the science of family med­
icine will involve striving to attain three goals: (1) 
the design of reliable, quantitative, and clinically 
useful methods for measuring various aspects of 
the structure and functioning of the family system 
that will enable increasingly complex research 
questions to be addressed and will also facilitate 
communication among family scientists, (2) the 
elucidation of molecular and cellular mechanisms 
through which family systems interact with the 
body's regulatory networks to influence biologic 
and clinical events, and (3) the development of 
family-oriented treatment interventions that will 
promote health, improve the outcome of illness, or 
substantially and positively affect its course. Such 
treatment methods should be based on our knowl­
edge of the family system's role in the pathophys­
iology of illness and the recovery from illness.

Progress is being made in all of these areas. 
Significant work has been done to develop models 
depicting variables in family functioning that can 
be measured in a reliable and quantitative way. 
Hoffman7 and Reiss8 have made progress in de­
fining symptom transformation in families, while 
McCubbin and Patterson9 have developed methods 
for measuring family functioning. Several workers 
are investigating the family system’s influence on

768

cellular function, including Schleifer’s recent d 

onstration o f decreased lymphocyte stimulatio 
following the loss o f spouse and his suggestion that 
this may explain the excess morbidity and mortal 
ity during the period of bereavement.10 The volume
Family Therapy in Family Medicine by William 
Doherty and Macaran Baird11 summarizes the 
experience of utilizing a family-based approach 
to treat depression, anxiety, stress, chemical 
dependency, parent/child problems, and marital 
and sexual problems. This work, which focuses or 
dealing with the patient in the family context, was 
developed and tested over a five-year period in a 
rural primary care setting. Fogarty12 has recently 
indicated that it is necessary and possible to treat 
the family through the care of the index patient.

Thus, there is a scientific basis for the family in 
family medicine. The family was not “put” into 
the specialty of family practice for political or any 
other reasons. It was there from the beginning of 
the practice of medicine. Working to define the 
science, family medicine, and to translate new 
knowledge into improved treatment methodology 
based on the family system-biologic-clinical inter­
actions is a worthwhile objective for family physi­
cians and a major thrust for academic departments.

As for the question posed by Merkel, I believe 
the real issue is not one of divorce but rather how 
family physicians and family therapists can work 
together to define a new science and to improve 
the care of patients.
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